
BID TABULATION #1200              (CLOSED 7/28//2003 @ 4:45PM-CST)
PAVEMENT BREAKER, PNEUMATIC TAMPER & BORING TOOLS
PURCHASING AGENT:  JANINE WILANT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414)286-3916

DAVID J. DVORAK CO. L.F. GEORGE CO INGERGOLL-RAND COMPANY VERMEER-WISCONSIN
QTY/ PRICE/EACH PRICE/EACH PRICE/EACH PRICE/EACH

DESCRIPTION: EACH MFR/PART # TOTAL MFR/PART # TOTAL MFR/PART # TOTAL MFR/PART # TOTAL

PAVEMENT BREAKER-60 LB CLASS 
BREAKER; INGERSOLL RAND 3 $790.00 $2,370.00 $850.00 $2,550.00 $632.81 $1,898.43 NO BID

INGERSOLL RAND MX60A SULLAIR MPB60A INGERSOLL-RAND MX60A
PNEUMATIC TAMPER; MICHIGAN 
PNEUMATIC TOOL 3 NON-COMPLYING $735.00 $2,205.00 $593.00 $1,779.00 NO BID

SULLAIR MBT-6-1B INGERSOLL-RAND 341A2M
PNEUMATIC BORING TOOL-2 INCH 
VERMEER SIDEWALKER 
HAMMERHEAD MOLE 2 NO BID $2,935.00 $5,870.00 NO BID $2,360.00 $4,720.00

TT TECHNOLOGIES-55P 2 
INCH TOOL W/ 50 FT HOSE

VERMEER HAMMERHEAD 
MOLE 2 INCH SW

PNEUMATIC BORING TOOL-4 INCH 
VERMEER LIGHTWEIGHT 
HAMMERHEAD MOLE 2 NO BID $4,934.00 $9,868.00 NO BID $4,450.00 $8,900.00

TT TECHNOLOGIES-95PK 
W/50FT HOSE

VERMEER HAMMERHEAD 
MOLE 4 INCH LW

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINES 1 THROUGH 4) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING
WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.


