
BID 868     (OPENING:  4/2/02)
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR SAND, STONE & GRAVEL
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395

*$0.00=NO BID
BIDDER: ITEM A ITEM B

PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL
FRANKLIN AGGREGATES NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
(FKA PAYNE & DOLAN INC) SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00

AVERAGE 4620 5100

HALQUIST STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 4620 5100

JOHNSON SAND & GRAVEL INC NORTHSIDE $4.95 NORTHSIDE $6.25
SOUTHSIDE $4.85 SOUTHSIDE $6.15
AVERAGE $4.90 4620 $22,638.00 $6.20 5100 $31,620.00

LANNON STONE PRODUCTS NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $6.90
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $7.90
AVERAGE 4620 $7.40 5100 $37,740.00

PAYNE & DOLAN INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $7.85
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $7.40
AVERAGE 4620 $7.63 5100 $38,887.50

WAUKESHA LIME & STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 4620 5100

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY ITEM OR IN TOTAL, WHICHEVER IS DEEMED TO BE IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY, TO THE LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER COMPLYING WITH SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.  LOW TOTAL WILL BE DETERMINED BY MULTIPLYING THE AVERAGE COST OF THE
PRICE PER TON FOR NORTH AND SOUTHSIDE DELIVERY TIMES THE ESTIMATED USAGE AMOUNT FOR THAT ITEM.  BIDDERS MUST QUOTE A PRICE PER TON
FOR BOTH NORTH AND SOUTHSIDE DELIVERY LOCATIONS TO BE CONSIDERED FOR AN AWARD FOR THAT LINE ITEM.
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BID 868     (OPENING:  4/2/02)
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR SAND, STONE & GRAVEL
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395

*$0.00=NO BID
BIDDER: ITEM C ITEM D

PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL
FRANKLIN AGGREGATES NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $8.35
(FKA PAYNE & DOLAN INC) SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $7.95

AVERAGE 1200 $8.15 27000 $220,050.00

HALQUIST STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $8.25
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $8.45
AVERAGE 1200 $8.35 27000 $225,450.00

JOHNSON SAND & GRAVEL INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 1200 27000

LANNON STONE PRODUCTS NORTHSIDE $10.50 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $11.50 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE $11.00 1200 $13,200.00 27000

PAYNE & DOLAN INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 1200 27000

WAUKESHA LIME & STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 1200 27000
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BID 868     (OPENING:  4/2/02)
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR SAND, STONE & GRAVEL
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395

*$0.00=NO BID
BIDDER: ITEM E ITEM F

PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL
FRANKLIN AGGREGATES NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
(FKA PAYNE & DOLAN INC) SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00

AVERAGE 750 27000

HALQUIST STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 750 2700

JOHNSON SAND & GRAVEL INC NORTHSIDE $6.65 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $6.55 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE $6.60 750 $4,950.00 2700

LANNON STONE PRODUCTS NORTHSIDE $6.50 NORTHSIDE $6.50
SOUTHSIDE $7.80 SOUTHSIDE $7.00
AVERAGE $7.15 750 $5,362.50 $6.75 2700 $18,225.00

PAYNE & DOLAN INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 750 2700

WAUKESHA LIME & STONE CO NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $23.40
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $23.40
AVERAGE 750 $23.40 2700 $63,180.00
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BID 868     (OPENING:  4/2/02)
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR SAND, STONE & GRAVEL
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395

*$0.00=NO BID
BIDDER: ITEM G ITEM H

PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL
FRANKLIN AGGREGATES NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
(FKA PAYNE & DOLAN INC) SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00

AVERAGE 117000 3900

HALQUIST STONE CO NORTHSIDE $8.25 NORTHSIDE $6.75
SOUTHSIDE $8.45 SOUTHSIDE $6.95
AVERAGE $8.35 117000 $976,950.00 $6.85 3900 $26,715.00

JOHNSON SAND & GRAVEL INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 117000 3900

LANNON STONE PRODUCTS NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $6.50
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $7.00
AVERAGE 117000 $6.75 3900 $26,325.00

PAYNE & DOLAN INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 117000 3900

WAUKESHA LIME & STONE CO NORTHSIDE $9.60 NORTHSIDE $9.35
SOUTHSIDE $9.10 SOUTHSIDE $8.85
AVERAGE $9.35 117000 $1,093,950.00 $9.10 3900 $35,490.00

TAB868.xls Page 4



BID 868     (OPENING:  4/2/02)
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR SAND, STONE & GRAVEL
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE MEREDITH-BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-2395

*$0.00=NO BID
BIDDER: ITEM I ITEM J

PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL PRICE/TON EST USAGE TOTAL
FRANKLIN AGGREGATES NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
(FKA PAYNE & DOLAN INC) SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00

AVERAGE 6000 15000

HALQUIST STONE CO NORTHSIDE $7.50 NORTHSIDE $8.25
SOUTHSIDE $7.70 SOUTHSIDE $8.45
AVERAGE $7.60 6000 $45,600.00 $8.35 15000 $125,250.00

JOHNSON SAND & GRAVEL INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 6000 15000

LANNON STONE PRODUCTS NORTHSIDE $6.50 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $7.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE $6.75 6000 $40,500.00 15000

PAYNE & DOLAN INC NORTHSIDE $0.00 NORTHSIDE $0.00
SOUTHSIDE $0.00 SOUTHSIDE $0.00
AVERAGE 6000 15000

WAUKESHA LIME & STONE CO NORTHSIDE $9.20 NORTHSIDE $9.50
SOUTHSIDE $8.70 SOUTHSIDE $9.00
AVERAGE $8.95 6000 $53,700.00 $9.25 15000 $138,750.00
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