
BID TABULATION #1757     CLOSED 03/07/2006 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB W/CONVENTIONAL CAB SPECIFICATION #35-C-64AA, DATED 11/11/2005
HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK MOUNTED SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
PURCHASING AGENT:  JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
TELEPHONE NUMBER:  414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35c-B-11, DATED 11/11/2005
EMAIL:  jwilan@milwaukee.gov SPECIFICATION #35-D-21g, DATED 11/15/2005

BIDDER:  BADGER TRUCK CENTER - MILWAUKEE, WI
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB STERLING ACTERRA 1 62,242.00$             62,242.00$                 
OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 750.00$                  750.00$                     

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE 1 NO BID -$                           

TOTAL BID 62,992.00$      

BIDDER:  BADGER TRUCK CENTER - WEST ALLIS, WI
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB GM C-8500 TANDEM 1 58,925.32$             58,925.32$                 
OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 185.00$                  185.00$                     

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE 1 NO BID -$                           

TOTAL BID 59,110.32$      

BIDDER:  CASPERS TRUCK EQUIPMENT
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB 1 NO BID -$                           
OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 -$                           

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE

CASPER BODY, 
PRENTICE 124 1 68,682.00$             68,682.00$                 

TOTAL BID 68,682.00$      

BIDDER:  LAKESIDE INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB

INTERNATIONAL 7400 
SBA 6 X 4 1 60,310.00$             60,310.00$                 

OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 FREE-WEB BASED -$                           

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE 1 NO BID -$                           

TOTAL BID 60,310.00$      
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BID TABULATION #1757     CLOSED 03/07/2006 @ 2:00 PM-CST
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB W/CONVENTIONAL CAB SPECIFICATION #35-C-64AA, DATED 11/11/2005
HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK MOUNTED SPECIFICATION #70b-D-5, DATED 11/15/2005
PURCHASING AGENT:  JANINE WILANT SPECIFICATION #34-A-13, DATED 4/15/2004
TELEPHONE NUMBER:  414-286-3916 SPECIFICATION #35c-B-11, DATED 11/11/2005
EMAIL:  jwilan@milwaukee.gov SPECIFICATION #35-D-21g, DATED 11/15/2005

BIDDER:  MONROE TRUCK EQUIPMENT
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB 1 NO BID -$                           
OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 -$                           

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE

PRENTICE 124 BC/ 
PARKHURST/CRYSTEEL 1 80,000.00$             80,000.00$                 

TOTAL BID 80,000.00$      

BIDDER:  TRUCK COUNTRY
MANUFACTURER/ UNIT

ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # QTY-EA PRICE-EACH TOTAL

1
TRUCK CHASSIS, 6 X 4, 56,000 LB GVW, 
W/CONVENTIONAL CAB FREIGHTLINER M2106 1 58,268.00$             58,268.00$                 
OPTION:  PARTS LIST & SHOP MANUALS 1 800.00$                  800.00$                     

2

HYDRAULIC LOG LOADER CRANE, TRUCK 
MOUNTED, WITH STEEL PLATFORM BODY, 
DUMPING TYPE 1 NO BID -$                           

TOTAL BID 59,068.00$      

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINES 1 AND 2) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND
RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS, THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS, AND
THE INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS THAT IS DEEMED IN THE BEST INTEREST OF THE CITY.
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