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CITY-WIDE VSC FOR IT PROFESSIONAL SERVICES OPENED 6/15/2010 @ 2:00 PM-CST
PURCHASING AGENT:  WINONA MARSHALL
TELEPHONE NO.:  (414) 286-3612
EMAIL:  WINONA.MARSHALL@MILWAUKEE.GOV
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1.0
1.1 IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER $89.00 $90.00 $95.00 $200.00 $95.00 $110.00 $125.00 $95.00
1.2 PROJECT LEADER $75.00 $70.00 $90.00 $125.00 $90.00 $100.00 $105.00 $90.00
1.3 SYSTEMS ANALYST $75.00 $70.00 $75.00 $90.00 $87.50 $90.00 $95.00 $85.00
1.4 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $69.00 $65.00 $75.00 $90.00 $85.00 $80.00 $88.00 $80.00
1.5 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $69.00 $55.00 $72.00 $75.00 $82.50 $75.00 $83.00 $80.00
1.6 WEB DESIGNER $45.00 $60.00 $60.00 $75.00 $82.50 $78.00 $78.00 $75.00
1.7 DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST $95.00 $55.00 $65.00 $65.00 $65.00 $62.00 $66.00 $95.00

$517.00 $465.00 $532.00 $720.00 $587.50 $595.00 $640.00 $600.00

2.0
2.1 PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT $75.00 $100.00 $115.00 $175.00 $145.00 $135.00
2.2 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE $85.00 $90.00 $95.00 $140.00 $135.00 $125.00
2.3 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS//PAYROLL SUITE $85.00 $90.00 $90.00 $140.00 $135.00 $125.00
2.4 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE $89.00 $90.00 $90.00 $125.00 $120.00 $250.00
2.5 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE $89.00 $90.00 $90.00 $125.00 $120.00 $250.00

$423.00 $460.00 $480.00 $705.00 $655.00 $885.00 $0.00

3.0 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS)
3.1 SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $45.00 $80.00 $40.00 $125.00 $110.00 $95.00
3.2 JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $39.00 $65.00 $25.00 $75.00 $65.00 $89.00
3.3 SENIOR GIS ANALYST $65.00 $80.00 $60.00 $125.00 $110.00 $95.00
3.4 JUNIOR GIS ANALYST $55.00 $65.00 $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $89.00

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3.0 $204.00 $290.00 $175.00 $400.00 $0.00 $360.00 $368.00 $0.00

4.0 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT
4.1 DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR $79.00 $85.00 $75.00 $125.00 $90.00 $85.00 $100.00 $95.00
4.2 LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS $75.00 $80.00 $65.00 $125.00 $90.00 $82.00 $95.00 $140.00
4.3 NETWORK SPECIALIST $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 $90.00 $85.00 $65.00 $88.00 $85.00
4.4 TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST $69.00 $70.00 $70.00 $90.00 $80.00 $78.00 $75.00 $50.00
4.5 HELPDESK TECHNICIAN $33.00 $50.00 $40.00 $55.00 $72.00 $48.00 $55.00 $80.00

$331.00 $355.00 $320.00 $485.00 $417.00 $358.00 $413.00 $450.00

N/A N/A YES N/A N/A N/A N/A YES

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

TOTAL FOR SECTION 1.0

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2.0

TOTAL FOR SECTION 4.0

APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT

ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT

NO BID
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1.0 APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT
1.1 IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER $88.00 $75.00 $150.00 $75.00 $117.83 $120.00 $64.50 $74.00
1.2 PROJECT LEADER $80.00 $65.00 $125.00 $65.00 $100.70 $90.00 $60.50 $64.00
1.3 SYSTEMS ANALYST $75.00 $65.00 $100.00 $55.00 $78.69 $80.00 $58.50 $64.00
1.4 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $70.00 $75.00 $100.00 $60.00 $83.93 $70.00 $58.50 $64.00
1.5 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $65.00 $70.00 $90.00 $47.00 $77.80 $70.00 $54.50 $64.00
1.6 WEB DESIGNER $60.00 $75.00 $90.00 $47.00 $57.70 $70.00 $44.50 $64.00
1.7 DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST $50.00 $60.00 $75.00 $31.00 $67.49 $60.00 $47.25 $58.00

$488.00 $485.00 $730.00 $380.00 $584.14 $560.00 $388.25 $452.00

2.0 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT
2.1 PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT $95.00 $90.00 $88.00 $146.88 $100.00 $77.75 $78.00
2.2 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE $90.00 $90.00 $73.00 $141.63 $95.00 $71.50 $74.00
2.3 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS//PAYROLL SUITE $90.00 $90.00 $79.00 $141.63 $95.00 $76.50 $74.00
2.4 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE $75.00 $80.00 $50.00 $125.20 $80.00 $76.50 $74.00
2.5 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE $75.00 $80.00 $52.00 $125.20 $80.00 $76.50 $74.00

$425.00 $430.00 $0.00 $342.00 $680.54 $450.00 $378.75 $374.00

3.0 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS)
3.1 SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $55.00 $70.00 $60.00 $55.00 $80.00 $55.50
3.2 JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $45.00 $60.00 $45.00 $28.00 $75.00 $48.25
3.3 SENIOR GIS ANALYST $65.00 $75.00 $90.00 $60.00 $80.00 $58.75
3.4 JUNIOR GIS ANALYST $55.00 $65.00 $75.00 $32.00 $75.00 $49.50

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3.0 $220.00 $270.00 $270.00 $175.00 $0.00 $310.00 $212.00 $0.00

4.0 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT
4.1 DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR $68.00 $85.00 $120.00 $70.00 $93.37 $80.00 $67.25 $64.00
4.2 LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS $63.00 $75.00 $120.00 $65.00 $86.45 $75.00 $60.75 $59.00
4.3 NETWORK SPECIALIST $57.50 $65.00 $100.00 $47.00 $78.69 $75.00 $58.25 $58.00
4.4 TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST $55.00 $65.00 $90.00 $40.00 $62.95 $70.00 $62.75 $58.00
4.5 HELPDESK TECHNICIAN $40.00 $60.00 $75.00 $33.00 $47.21 $55.00 $35.75 $54.00

$283.50 $350.00 $505.00 $255.00 $368.67 $355.00 $284.75 $293.00

N/A YES N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2.0

TOTAL FOR SECTION 4.0

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION

TOTAL FOR SECTION 1.0
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1.0 APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT
1.1 IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER $100.00 $145.00 $85.00 $140.00 $82.00 $120.00 $120.00 $143.75
1.2 PROJECT LEADER $85.00 $145.00 $80.00 $120.00 $79.00 $90.00 $90.00 $122.38
1.3 SYSTEMS ANALYST $75.00 $135.00 $70.00 $100.00 $75.00 $80.00 $80.00 $112.28
1.4 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $70.00 $135.00 $65.00 $87.55 $75.00 $80.00 $72.00 $99.50
1.5 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $65.00 $135.00 $60.00 $82.40 $70.00 $68.00 $60.00 $92.21
1.6 WEB DESIGNER $60.00 $135.00 $60.00 $92.70 $64.00 $60.00 $68.00 $85.50
1.7 DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST $50.00 $110.00 $55.00 $77.25 $64.00 $50.00 $50.00 $108.24

$505.00 $940.00 $475.00 $699.90 $509.00 $548.00 $540.00 $763.86

2.0 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT
2.1 PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT $125.00 $145.00 $90.00 $135.00 $100.00 $115.00 $115.00
2.2 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE $100.00 $135.00 $85.00 $103.00 $95.00 $90.00 $95.00
2.3 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS//PAYROLL SUITE $100.00 $135.00 $85.00 $103.00 $95.00 $90.00 $95.00
2.4 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE $90.00 $125.00 $70.00 $92.70 $100.00 $80.00 $95.00
2.5 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE $90.00 $125.00 $70.00 $92.70 $100.00 $80.00 $95.00

$505.00 $665.00 $400.00 $526.40 $490.00 $0.00 $455.00 $495.00

3.0 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS)
3.1 SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $75.00 $85.00 $97.85 $75.00 $75.00 $94.00
3.2 JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $65.00 $55.00 $92.70 $65.00 $65.00 $84.08
3.3 SENIOR GIS ANALYST $75.00 $75.00 $97.85 $75.00 $75.00 $94.00
3.4 JUNIOR GIS ANALYST $65.00 $55.00 $92.70 $65.00 $65.00 $84.08

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3.0 $280.00 $0.00 $270.00 $381.10 $280.00 $0.00 $280.00 $356.16

4.0 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT
4.1 DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR $110.00 $145.00 $85.00 $118.45 $89.00 $85.00 $85.00 $139.91
4.2 LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS $85.00 $145.00 $80.00 $118.45 $89.00 $85.00 $80.00 $94.00
4.3 NETWORK SPECIALIST $70.00 $135.00 $65.00 $103.00 $76.00 $68.00 $70.00 $99.30
4.4 TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST $60.00 $135.00 $60.00 $92.70 $76.00 $55.00 $70.00 $87.73
4.5 HELPDESK TECHNICIAN $45.00 $135.00 $35.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $45.00 $80.30

$370.00 $695.00 $325.00 $477.60 $370.00 $333.00 $350.00 $501.24

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION

TOTAL FOR SECTION 1.0

TOTAL FOR SECTION 4.0

LBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2.0
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1.0 APPLICATIONS DEVELOPMENT
1.1 IT PROJECT MANAGER - PROGRAM MANAGER $120.00 $95.00
1.2 PROJECT LEADER $100.00 $83.00
1.3 SYSTEMS ANALYST $80.00 $73.00
1.4 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $80.00 $80.00
1.5 PROGRAMMER/ANALYST $75.00 $80.00
1.6 WEB DESIGNER $60.00 $63.00
1.7 DOCUMENTATION SPECIALIST $60.00 $65.00

$575.00 $539.00

2.0 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT AND SUPPORT
2.1 PROJECT LEADER - ORACLE PEOPLESOFT DEVELOPMENT $97.00
2.2 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - FINANCIAL SUITE $90.00
2.3 SENIOR ORACLE PEOPLESOFT ANALYST/DEVELOPER - HRMS//PAYROLL SUITE $90.00
2.4 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - FINANCIAL SUITE $90.00
2.5 ORACLE PEOPLESOFT TRAINER - HRMS/PAYROLL SUITE $90.00

$0.00 $457.00

3.0 GEOGRAPHIC INFORMATION SYSTEMS (GIS)
3.1 SENIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $85.00 $75.00
3.2 JUNIOR GIS TECHNICIAN $75.00 $66.00
3.3 SENIOR GIS ANALYST $90.00 $85.00
3.4 JUNIOR GIS ANALYST $85.00 $69.00

TOTAL FOR SECTION 3.0 $335.00 $295.00

4.0 MAINFRAME OPERATIONS AND TECHNICAL SUPPORT
4.1 DATABASE ADMINISTRATOR $80.00 $85.00
4.2 LEAD SYSTEMS ANALYST - NETWORKS $75.00 $75.00
4.3 NETWORK SPECIALIST $75.00 $70.00
4.4 TECHNICAL SYSTEMS ANALYST $70.00 $75.00
4.5 HELPDESK TECHNICIAN $60.00 $29.00

$360.00 $334.00

N/A N/ALBE AFFIDAVIT SUBMITTED?

NO BID

TOTAL FOR SECTION 1.0

TOTAL FOR SECTION 2.0

GROUP NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION

TOTAL FOR SECTION 4.0
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NON-COMPLYING BIDS WERE RECEIVED FROM THE FOLLOWING:
BEST BUY FOR BUSINESS (DID NOT COMPLY WITH EBE REQUIREMENT, DID NOT COMPLY WITH LIVING WAGE PROVISION, DID NOT RETURN PRICING ON ATTACHMENT A)
EXPITAS LLC (DID NOT COMPLETE EBE FORM AS DIRECTED, DID NOT QUOTE ALL POSITIONS IN GROUP 1.0)
INTERBASE CORPORATION (DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM #2, DID NOT RETURN REQUIRED EBE FORM B, DID NOT RETURN LIVING WAGE FORM)

AWARD OF BID: 
THE CITY OF MILWAUKEE'S IT PROCUREMENT PROCESS IS HIGHLY DECENTRALIZED. EACH DEPARTMENT WILL SOLICIT SERVICES UNDER ITS OWN AUTHORITY AS THE NEED FOR 
SERVICES ARISES. THEREFORE, MULTIPLE AWARDS WILL BE MADE TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER(S) COMPLYING WITH THE BID SPECIFICATIONS AND 
COMPLETION OF APPENDIX A. LOW BIDDER(S) WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF ALL POSITIONS QUOTED IN A PARTICULAR GROUP (GROUPS 1.0-4.0 OF APPENDIX A). 
BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL POSITIONS LISTED IN A GROUP TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AWARD OF THAT GROUP.


