
BID #1610 - TRUCK CHASSIS, REFUSE, RECYCLING AND DUMP BODIES
CLOSING:  APRIL 21, 2005 @ 2:00 PM
PURCHASING AGENT:  AILEEN HALEY SPECS: 35-C-58AL(2/18/05), 35-C-37AA(3/4/05), 35-D-20W (3/4/05), 35-D-25W(2/25/05), 
TELEPHONE NO:  414-286-3506 35-D-25Z(3/3/05), 35-C-35AA(1/24/05), 35-D-7S(1/25/05), 35C-A-13(2/2/05), 35-D-6P(2/2/05)

35C-A-18 (2/2/05), 35C-A-19 (2/2/05), DRAWING NOS: 2000-7, 2000-4, 2005-1, 2000-6 &
EMAIL:  AHALEY@MILWAUKEE.GOV 2000-9, 70B-D-5 (3/18/05) AND 34-A-13 (4/15/04)

BIDDERS: QTY: BADGER BRUCE CASPERS CUMBERLAND LAKESIDE INT'L LAKESIDE INT'L MCNEILUS MILW. MONROE OLSON R.N.O.W. STEPP TRUCK
TRK CTR MUN. TRK SERVICENTER BID #1 BID #2 TRK MACK TRK TRAILER INC. EQUIP. CTY

ITEM 1: 16 $105,940.00 NO BID NO BID $117,260.00 NO BID $124,583.00 NO BID $113,114.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MFR & #: STERLING CRANE AUTOCAR MACK LE613

CONDOR CARRIER WXLL64
TOTAL: $1,695,040.00 $1,876,160.00 $1,993,328.00 $1,809,826.72

ITEM 2: 1 $53,447.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $52,825.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $53,950.00
MFR & #: STERLING INT'L 7300 M2 80

ACTERRA 4 X 2
TOTAL: $53,447.00 $52,825.00 $53,950.00

ITEM 3: 1 NO BID $58,118.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $56,450.00 NO BID
MFR & #: LEACH MCNEILUS 2011 HEIL PT-1000

ALPHA III
TOTAL: $58,118.00 $55,900.00 $56,450.00

ITEM 4: 10 NO BID $53,683.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $53,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $52,522.95 $60,990.00 NO BID
MFR & #: LEACH MCNEILUS 2513 PAK-MOR HEIL POWER

2RIII RNY325B TRACK COMM.
TOTAL: $536,830.00 $537,000.00 $525,229.50 $609,900.00

BID #2
$59,770.00

HEIL DURAPACK
5000

$597,700.00
ITEM 5: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID $97,527.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92,710.00 $116,800.00 NO BID
MFR & #: G&H MFG PAK-MOR HEIL FORMULA

R90 RDG125B-9-14 4060 SPLITBODY
TOTAL: $585,162.00 $556,260.00 $700,800.00

ITEM 6: 11 $53,733.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $52,545.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $54,480.00
MFR & #: STERLING INT'L 7300 M2 80

ACTERRA 4 X 2



TOTAL: $591,063.00 $577,995.00 $599,280.00

PAGE 2
BID #1610 - TRUCK CHASSIS, REFUSE, RECYCLING AND DUMP BODIES
CLOSING DATE: 04/21/05 @ 2:00 PM

BIDDERS: QTY: BADGER BRUCE CASPER'S CUMBERLAND LAKESIDE INT'L LAKESIDE INT'L MCNEILUS MILW. MONROE OLSON R.N.O.W. STEPP TRUCK
TRK CTR MUN. TRK SERVICENTER BID #1 BID #2 TRK MACK TRK TRAILER INC. EQUIP. CTY

ITEM 7: 11 NO BID NO BID $68,541.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63,111.00 $73,473.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MFR & #: SCHMIDT CRYSTEEL & HEIL SL316

GALLION MONROE SWENSON EVA
SWENSON (SEE THEIR BID 100-12-48

FOR PART #'S)
TOTAL: $753,951.00 $694,221.00 $808,203.00

NON-COMPLYING BID:
WHITE HOUSE EQUIPMENT SALES LLC

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH 
THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.

NOTE FOR LINE ITEMS 5, 6 & 7:  THE LOW BIDDER WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE PRICES QUOTED FOR EACH LINE ITEM
AND WILL NOT INCLUDE PRICES QUOTED FOR THE POSSIBLE PURCHASE OF THE ADDITIONAL UNITS.


