
Bid 883 - Vendor Contract for Toilet Paper/Paper Towel
Purchasing Agent: Diane Meredith-Berndt
Telephone: 414-286-2395

LINE 1 Clover Dist Nassco San-a-Care ER Abernathy THP, LLC Unisource AMH Thomas Scient.
Item 1 - Toilet Paper No bid Non-complying Non-complying Non-complying No Bid No Bid
% Recycled 100% 40%
# of Sheets/Roll 1500 1500
# Rolls/Case 60 48
Price Per Roll $0.52 $0.66
Price Per Case $31.35 $31.65
Estimated usage: 1000 cases $31,350.00 $31,650.00

LINE 2
Item 1 - Multifold Towels No Bid
# per package 250 200
# packages/case 16 20
Price per package $0.77 $0.56
# towels per case 4000 4000
Price per case $12.25 $11.10
Estimated usage - 1200 cases $14,700.00 $13,320.00

Item 1 - Multifold Towels - Optional bid No Bid
# per package 250 250
# packages/case 16 16
Price per package $0.72 $0.77
# towels per case 4000 4000
Price per case $11.45 $12.25
Estimated usage - 1200 cases $13,740.00 $14,700.00

Item 2 - Single Fold Towels
# per package 250 250 250
# packages/case 16 16 16
Price per package $0.73 $0.71 $0.75
# per case 4000 4000 4000
Price per case $11.63 $11.40 $12.05
Estimated usage - 8500 cases $98,855.00 $96,900.00 $102,425.00
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Item 2 - Single Fold Towels - Optional bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Non-complying Non-complying Non-complying No Bid No Bid
# per package
# packages/case
Price per package
# per case
Price per case

Item 3 - C Fold Towels Non-complying
# per package 200 240
# packages/case 12 10
Price per package 1.20333 1.285
# per case 2400 2400
Price per case $14.44 $12.85
Estimated usage - 220 cases $3,176.80 $2,827.00

Item 3 - C Fold Towels - Optional Bid No Bid No Bid
# per package 240
# packages/case 10
Price per package $1.29
# per case 2400
Price per case $12.85
Estimated usage - 220 cases $2,827.00

Item 4 - Kimberly Clark Jumbo Roll Bath TissueNo Bid No Bid
# of sheets per roll 1000'
# rolls per case 12
Price per roll $2.72
Price per case $32.58
Estimated usage - 1600 cases $52,128.00

Item 5 - Kimberly Clark 1 ply roll towel No Bid No Bid
# of sheets per roll 425'
# rolls per case 12
Price per roll $3.44
Price per case $41.33
Estimated usage - 1400 cases $57,862.00


