BID TAB: 561
PURCHASING AGENT: DIANE BERNDT
TELEPHONE NO.: 414-286-2395

BIDDER: ITEMA ITEM B ITEMC TOTAL
AMERICAN LAFRANCE MEDICMASTER $3,024.67 $174.00 $69.25 $3,267.92
ARMSTRONG MEDICAL NO BID

C D MEDICAL INC NO BID

CON MED CORP NO BID

ELVINS SAFETY SUPPLY INC NO BID

LAERDAL MEDICAL CORP $3,420.20 $196.00 $77.42 $3,693.62
LIFESAVING RESOURCES NO BID

MDS MATRX MEDICAL INC $3,184.00 $178.00 $73.50 $3,435.50
MEDICAL RESEARCH LABS $3,225.83 $162.00 $247.05 $3,634.88
MEDTRONIC PHYSIO-CONTROL NO BID

PARR EMERGENCY PRODUCTS $3,071.20 $170.00 $75.05 $3,316.25
PAUL CONWAY SHIELDS NO BID

SAFETY SYSTEMS CORP NO BID

AN AWARD WILL BE MADE IN TOTAL TO THE LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH BID SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENT
BIDDERS MUST BID ALL LINE ITEMS TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.



