
BID 0000000511
VENDOR CONTRACT FOR ALUMINUM CASTINGS
PURCHASING AGENT:  DIANE BERNDT
TELEPHONE:  414-286-2395

VENDOR: ITEM A ITEM B ITEM C ITEM D ITEM E ITEM F ITEM G GRAND TOTAL
AFW FOUNDRY EST USAGE 1800 3000 2400 450 180 150 150

PRICE $3.86 $3.39 $9.74 $47.84 $16.53 $3.08 $1.41
TOTAL $6,948.00 $10,170.00 $23,376.00 $21,528.00 $2,975.40 $462.00 $211.50 $65,670.90

AMERALLY STEEL EST USAGE
(NO BID) PRICE

B & P ALLOYS EST USAGE 1800 3000 2400 450 180 150 150
PRICE $3.41 $2.57 $8.75 $60.00 $14.91 $14.74 $1.47
TOTAL $6,138.00 $7,710.00 $21,000.00 $27,000.00 $2,683.80 $2,211.00 $220.50 $66,963.30

COMPONENT PROD EST USAGE 1800 3000 2400 450 180 150 150
PRICE $7.36 $7.36 $11.13 $40.11 $16.56 $18.40 $2.53
TOTAL $13,248.00 $22,080.00 $26,712.00 $18,049.50 $2,980.80 $2,760.00 $379.50 $86,209.80

GEN TRAFFIC EQUIP EST USAGE
(NO BID) PRICE

NEHER ELECTRIC EST USAGE 
(NO BID) PRICE

NO ALUMINUM FOUND EST USAGE 1800 3000 2400 450 180 150 150
PRICE $6.38 $3.78 $4.79 $44.67 $15.45 $11.71 $2.12
TOTAL $11,484.00 $11,340.00 $11,496.00 $20,101.50 $2,781.00 $1,756.50 $318.00 $59,277.00

SUPREME CASTING EST USAGE 1800 3000 2400 450 180 150 150
PRICE $5.85 $4.70 $11.45 $42.25 $22.35 $12.85 $2.45
TOTAL $10,530.00 $14,100.00 $27,480.00 $19,012.50 $4,023.00 $1,927.50 $367.50 $77,440.50

TRAFFIC PARTS INC EST USAGE
(NO BID) PRICE

AN AWARD WILL BE MADE IN TOTAL TO THE LOW RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE BIDDER COMPLYING WITH BID
SPECIFICATIONS AND DELIVERY REQUIREMENTS.  LOW TOTAL WILL BE DETERMINED FROM THE GRAND TOTAL OF ALL
DISCOUNTED PRICES TIMES THE ESTIMATED USAGE AMOUNTS FOR EACH.  BIDDERS MUST QUOTE ALL ITEMS LISTED
TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR AN AWARD.


